
Autumn 1 Weekly Timetable for Home Learning: Year 2 

 

 

Day 6 Day 7 Day 8 Day 9 Day 10 

Daily Exercise – for example 
Joe Wicks 30 minutes  

Daily Exercise – for example 
Joe Wicks 30 minutes 

Daily Exercise – for example 
Joe Wicks 30 minutes 

Daily Exercise – for example 
Joe Wicks 30 minutes 

Daily Exercise – for example 
Joe Wicks 30 minutes 

Daily Reading - 20 minutes 
Independent: Oxford Reading 
tree or Rigby Star book. With 
adult: Non-Fiction Book 

Daily Reading - 20 minutes 
Independent: Oxford Reading 
tree or Rigby Star book. With 
adult: Non-Fiction Book 

Daily Reading - 20 minutes 
Independent: Oxford Reading 
tree or Rigby Star book. With 
adult: Non-Fiction Book 

Daily Reading - 20 minutes 
Independent: Oxford Reading 
tree or Rigby Star book. With 
adult: Non-Fiction Book 

Daily Reading - 20 minutes 
Independent: Oxford Reading 
tree or Rigby Star book. With 
adult: Non-Fiction Book 

Daily Literacy session:  
Reading: Read the text A 
Monster Surprise and underline 
key words. 
Spelling: Choose 10 Year 2 
common exception words. Use 
the Look, say, cover, write & 
check method. 

Daily Literacy session:  
Reading: Read the text A 
Monster Surprise and answer 
the questions 
Writing: Using the common 
exception words from yesterday 
write full sentences using those 
words. 

Daily Literacy session:  
 Reading: Read the text Around 
the world in 80 days and 
underline key words. 
Spelling: Choose 10 different 
Year 2 common exception 
words. Use the Look, say, cover, 
write & check method. 

Daily Literacy session:  
 Reading: Read the text Around 
the world in 80 and answer the 
questions 
Writing: Using the common 
exception words from yesterday 
write full sentences using those 
words 

Daily Literacy session:  
 Writing: Make a poster about 
the UK. Include: What countries 
make up the UK. Some fun facts 
about the UK. The history of 
London. Write about one of the 
landmarks that you can find in 
London. 

Daily maths: 
Fact Families (video) 
https://whiterosemaths.com/homelear
ning/year-2/week-5/ 

Daily maths: 
Check Calculations (video) 

https://whiterosemaths.com/homelear
ning/year-2/week-5/ 

Daily maths: 
 Compare Number Sentences 
(video) 
https://whiterosemaths.com/homelear
ning/year-2/week-5/ 

Daily maths: 
 Know your bonds (video) 
https://whiterosemaths.com/homelear
ning/year-2/week-5/ 

Daily maths:  
 Related Facts (video) 
https://whiterosemaths.com/homelear
ning/year-2/week-5/ 

Topic- Geography 
What is the United Kingdom? 
https://classroom.thenational.academ
y/lessons/what-is-the-united-
kingdom-71k32c  

Topic- Geography 
What can you find in the UK? 
https://classroom.thenational.academ
y/lessons/what-can-you-find-in-the-
united-kingdom-60u68d  

Topic- Geography 
What is the history of London? 
https://classroom.thenational.academ
y/lessons/what-is-the-history-of-
london-6dgp8r  

Topic- Geography 
How do people move around in 
London? 
https://classroom.thenational.academ
y/lessons/how-do-people-move-
around-in-london-68wkat  

Topic- Geography 
What are the landmarks of 
London? 
https://classroom.thenational.academ
y/lessons/what-are-the-landmarks-in-
london-71k3cc  

Suggested video: 
BBC Bitesize: Let’s explore the 
UK 

https://www.bbc.co.uk/bitesize/topics
/zyhp34j/articles/z4v3jhv  

Suggested video: 
BBC Bitesize: What are human 
& physical features? 
https://www.bbc.co.uk/bitesize/topics
/zqj3n9q/articles/zr8q7nb  

Suggested video: 
 BBC Bitesize: The wildlife of the 
River Thames 
https://www.bbc.co.uk/bitesize/clips/
z8qhyrd  

Suggested story: 
Coming to England 
https://www.bbc.co.uk/iplayer/episod
e/m000n2tz/cbeebies-bedtime-
stories-768-david-olusoga-coming-to-
england  

Suggested story: 
Mixed 
https://www.bbc.co.uk/iplayer/episod
e/b0bp2m7h/cbeebies-bedtime-
stories-655-radzi-chinyanganya-mixed  
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